

SOUTH DAKOTA DEPARTMENT OF GAME, FISH AND PARKS BID TABULATION

Summary of Bids for: Lodge Expansion and Renovation, Shadehill Recreation Area, Perkins County, SD, Project No. Shad19Pa

Bid Opening Date: August 9, 2018, 3:00 PM CT

Bids Received:				Scull Construction		First Dakota Enterprises		Kohn's Elect. & Construction		R P & H, Inc.	
No.	Item	Unit	Qty.	Unit	Amount	Unit	Amount	Unit	Amount	Unit	Amount
1.0	Mobilization	LS	1	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$21,700.00	\$21,700.00	\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00
2.0	Lodge Expansion/Renovation	LS	1	\$408,000.00	\$408,000.00	\$227,000.00	\$227,000.00	\$180,595.95	\$180,595.95	\$165,540.00	\$165,540.00
3.0	Tie into Existing Transformer	LS	1	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
4.0	200 Amp Underground Electrical	LF	150	\$12.00	\$1,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.00	\$1,500.00	\$15.00	\$2,250.00
TOTAL BASE BID				\$416,000.00		\$248,700.00		\$188,095.95		\$193,790.00	

Bids Received:				MAC Construction Co.		Albright Construction					
No.	Item	Unit	Qty.	Unit	Amount	Unit	Amount				
1.0	Mobilization	LS	1	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$7,000.00				
2.0	Lodge Expansion/Renovation	LS	1	\$250,000.00	\$250,000.00	\$137,500.00	\$137,500.00				
3.0	Tie into Existing Transformer	LS	1	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$110.00	\$110.00				
4.0	200 Amp Underground Electrical	LF	150	\$6.66	\$999.00	\$5.00	\$750.00				
TOTAL BASE BID				\$261,149.00		\$145,360.00					